
IFB #2019025-SURPLUS PROPERTY-FLEET VEHICLES 

DATE: OCTOBER 23, 2019, 1:00 P.M. 

 
BID RECEIVED- ITEM #6 

2008 Ford Explorer XLT 4X4 - 98,660 Miles 
Vin 1FMEU73818UA42259 (ABS Light is On) 

RESERVE $4000.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
Katherine Arismendez $4159.00 

  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #10 
2011 Chevrolet Tahoe 2WD - 126,271 Miles 

Vin 1GNLC2E09BR241974 

RESERVE $7000.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
NO BID  

  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #12 
2007 Ford F-150 4X4 - 144,519 Miles 

Vin 1FTRF14W57KB72548 

RESERVE $3500.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
Filiberto Chavira $3501.00 

  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #13 
2013 Ford F-150 - 99,239 Miles 

Vin 1FTMF1CM8DFC14211 
 

RESERVE $6200.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
NO BID  



  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #15 
2008 Ford F150 4X2 Super Cab 

96,275 Miles 
Vin 1FTPX12V28FB04989 

 

RESERVE $5400.00 

                               NAME BID AMOUNT 
NO BID  

  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #20 
2013 Ford F-150 Eco Boost - 112,031 miles 

Vin 1FTFW1CT1DKD08941 

RESERVE $11,000.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
Jeff & Valeria Becker $12,000.00 

  
  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #21 
2013 FORD F150 4X4 CREWCAB- 107,953 

miles VIN:1FTFW1ET0DKD61482 

RESERVE $11,000.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
NO BID  

  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #22 
2008 FORD F250 4X2 SPRCAB-94,476 miles 

VIN:1FTSX205X8EC99863 

RESERVE $2500.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
Connie Hamlett $3156.00 



  
  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #23 
2008 FORD F250 4X2 SVCBDY-90,555 miles 

VIN: 1FTNF20538ED63953 (SES light on)  

RESERVE $2,800.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
Jesse Deleon $3400.01 
Katherine Arismendez $3300.00 

  
  

BID RECEIVED- ITEM #24 
2008 CHEVY SILVERADO 2500 127,704 miles 

VIN: 1GCHK23658F123486  

RESERVE $11,500.00 

NAME BID AMOUNT 
Kyle Balland $13,500.34 
Jesse Deleon $13,500.01 
Filiberto Chavira $12,299.01 
Eric Bridges $15,150.00 

  

 

AWARDS:        NO BIDS: 

#6- Katherine Arismendez    #10 

#12-Filiberto Chavira     #13 

#20-Jeff & Valeria Becker    #15 

#22- Connie Hamlett     #21 

#23- Jesse Deleon       

#24- Eric Bridges 


